
A Resilient and Agile Supply Chain is Essential for our Operations and Stakeholders. 

Supply Chain Management

Why Is It Important?

PETRONAS relies on a range of products and services 
throughout our value chain, sourced from a vast global 
network of suppliers. 

Ethical and sustainable supply chains aid in product 
development, safeguard workers’ rights, and enhance 
operational safety. We view our supply chain as an 
opportunity to contribute to positive socio-economic 
impacts. It allows us to channel financial capital into 
businesses, including Small and Medium Enterprises (SMEs), 
empowering their growth in environmental protection, 
responsible sourcing and procurement practices.

What Is Our Approach?

Our suppliers must adhere to policies and standards in 
managing environmental and social impacts across our 
integrated oil and gas value chain. 

We have zero tolerance towards non-compliance, 
including our environmental and social standards. We 
conduct capacity building and engagement sessions to 
build capability and strengthen the resilience of the 
industry. To this end, we have been collaborating with 
nine financial institutions on the Vendor Financing 
Programme (VFP) to facilitate access to funding for 
vendors since 2018. We have also introduced Special Oil 
and Gas Services and Equipment (OGSE) Financing which 
targets underserved vendors with less than five years of 
experience. In driving sustainability, we partnered with 
industry players and government agencies by participating 
in the National OGSE Industry Blueprint roadshows in the 
Klang Valley, Sabah and Sarawak. We also participated in 
strategic forums such as the National OGSE Sustainability 
Forum.

We collaborated with OGSE industry players through our 
Vendor Development Programme (VDP) and SMEs to 
promote local entrepreneurship to contribute to socio-
economic growth and improve communities through an 
increase in employment opportunities. 

Policies and Guidelines

	 PETRONAS Contractors Code of Conduct on 

Human Rights (CoCHR).

	 PETRONAS Code of Conduct‑ and Business 

Ethics (CoBE).

	 PETRONAS Anti-Bribery and Corruption (ABC) 

Manual.

	 PETRONAS Whistleblowing Policy.
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